ucharuisuo)-He|eisiy

aL0ziszl6
\\l\\l\\l - B ~—
86°1LS85'LS 18'G22'Sz$ TS
dduejeg VIO IV1OL sjeq o) sainypuadx3 WI0L TN
\ 58°228'7¢3
/S ____poplemy sjunowy uononnsuod y.LOL
\
/ %00193|0)) Buines| \
00°00L'L$ 0000L°LS 00S# %0 lle1] 1s3104 umo | uo nedas SUON Siaysr %ie|D 810¢/9¢/S \ 81028020102
’ Aouabiawa) |anelb Jo speo| Q| \
,‘_. ‘g Wy Jad papiwgns sj|iq |je @ 333|dwod }a3loud 81/62/S /,
]
. f . (2£6$ 10 %09) PeOY
026558 , 02'655% 8¥i# 10 IIH YHON 3 Peoy sekoN pepelS S0012102 071 Buneaeox3 soop 2102/S/V 1 . 21221202102
UlWIISINQUND ﬁ asinquia adA aseyaind (s)wa # SlOAYY lopua ajeq
u _Ssu " 0 Eﬂ.._o,.__a EQEW il A A0puaA i #9910AU] VD
\ v d 0ju| 2210AU|
/
, S|IeJ} Q|2 SNOUEA UO (1Y Of) Jopeo] xoed) 1oedwor) 10 Japelb azis ||nym apelb o} Jopuaa aiiH |:uonduosaq 393[0dd paroiddy
<
N 08°8¥5$ 02'659°L$
8 ajuejeq VIO 3jeq o) sainypuadx3
[ 00'802°2$
¥d 404 Papiemy Junowy joel
———
s14) 10} 2q 0} psjou s|liq Aue pied Jo paAIgdal JuBABY SE Bq UBD SIY} MOY MOUY J,uop 'g My Jad pepiwgns sjiiq |e 8 9)ejdwod 1oafoid 81/62/S
> # 9210AU| ae
JuaWAsINGuIRY esunquiiay 9 M paseyaind (s)wayy 10pusA JOPUBA a # @210AU] VIO
jenjoy 0} Junowy JuswAhed g S310RUI
(s1y 0Z) el 3201 2 /M €80G Af/M dpeib 0} J0puaA a1y :8bpiy puod PN R Y2ION Bas|a)y ‘IIIH Jebng |:uondirosaq 19afold parosddy
00°0¥5$ 00'0%
adueeg V|9 8jeq o saanyipuadxy

00°0¥5$

£d 10} popiEMY Junowry }oERU0D




T FORBUREAUOF TRAILS USE ONLY

GRANT-IN-AID DATE INVOICE#

BILLING FORM ¥/3 g A/ 207080/

CLUB INFORMATION VENDOR CODE ENCUMBRANCE NUMBER
S\ etallak ATV Club I | [

GRANT VALUE BUISNESS OFFICE PAY

W9 ADRESS: PO .BOX 31 8 .
TOWNICITY g//j)a A7 85 4//00 o,
Colebrook CHARGED TO:
7IP CODE: TELEPHONE: 010035- FSLE 6 (77T D75-05%
" 03576 " AUTHPR.ZEDQ.GfoURE
07y M/
GRANT #: C/G&E 2017-07  cHECK IF CASH ADVANCE REQUEST: MONTH INCURRED: 7//[ M

Grooming & Grading reimbursement requests must include log sheets and be received at the Bureau by the“()th of the month for the
previous month's work. Reimbursement requests for plowing of approved parking lots must be accompanied by invoices indicating dates
of each plow. Construction and Equipment reimbursement requests must have invoices and proof of payment attached to this form.
All projects and equipment paid for in part by Grant in Aid is subject to audit.
DATE PROJECT#-DESCRIPTION OF WORK-MATERIALS USED-EQUIPMENT COSTIRATE QUANTITY CHARGE TO GIA

5/26/18 Invoice from Clark Jeffers $1,100.00 | 1.000 $1,100.00
$0.00

$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
2 $0.00

\\g $0.00

PR A $0.00
_aov $0.00
o\ v $0.00
K $0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00

$0.00

[~ INORDER TO RECEIVE REIMBURSEMENT - TRAIL ADMINISTRATOR
N ORDER TO RECEIVE REIMBURSEMENT - TRAIL ADMINISTRATOR MUST SIGN BELOW CLUBTOTALS [ 71000 O $1,100.00
DO NOT WRITE BELOW

PrTaME: \like Ouellet 7

: TRAIL ADMINISTRATOR - SIGNED UNDER PENALITY OF PERJURY
)] 00. oD

State of New Hampshire - Department of Natural and Cultural Resources - Divislon of Parks and Recreation
Bureau of Tralls 172 Pembroke Road Concord NH 03301 (603) 271-3254 FAX (603) 271-3553

8408,01 2018 Version



NOAJMNVHL

A8 03AIE03Y
Vi0L
e ‘sasuadxa |e6a) Bujpnjaul UONJIB|0D JO SISO B Aed o) saaibe
X Jowolsno ‘sasuejeq piedun jje uo Ajyuow 9,z jo abieys adueuld
'
1
i
|
|
I
|
i
1}
1
1)
1
]
1
1
1
m J
: oS H#
i .
H
1
1
}
i
'
1
i
"
:
1
; (
?

2/ r 7
i @ / |
M v GRS 7 B
m v (7 "l
i Wi Vi

O H 9

JZETO ANV IV,

H39WNN 3NCHd

A I W

. :a1eQ

1ourjuiodaiejAw@siayefo « 150e-G16-€09-1 -0

0008-222-208-} ‘D * 0008-L€2-€09-} ‘H

9/G€0 HN “100493]0D
‘PY e i

siayjer Mield

‘ssauisng 1nok 10f nok yuvyy

6€¢0 ©N

OQ;QM\QN |ejoy

o
<
<
~

A ¥

/
JOSH# ¥
W4
aD Q\wlﬁ\ 7 | 57
Qbb ONIN HrATNZ

LR T

[eJoL

(@) Tso: v uonduosag qor

jo# - ,
B T e

2L

:SS8lppy

A)\.S\(\,ﬂ%_.ﬁwz%mz
€v0S-L£2-€09
9/G€0 HN ‘umolspems)s
‘P 9|q0LIOSPIeH 92

uonanysuon uoyybie] sean



Meffert, Lisa

From: Mike Ouellet

Sent: Wednesday, May 30, 2018 10:13 AM
To: Meffert, Lisa

Cc:

Subject: Metallak ATV

Attachments: Scan_0020.pdf

Lisa,

Enclosed are 2 bills for work done that should deplete our 2017 GIA. I will forward the cancelled checks as soon as they are back
from the bank. Thank you and please do not hesitate to contact me with any questions.

Sent from my iPad



Meffert, Lisa

—_— —_— e ]
From: Meffert, Lisa
Sent: Monday, August 20, 2018 3:46 PM
To: ‘Mike Quellet-TA, Metallak ATV Club'
Cc: 'Arthur Beauchemin'; Craig Washburn-President, Metallak ATV
Subject: 2017 Summer GIA Construction Account Statement for Metallak ATV Club
Attachments: Metallak ATV Club Construction.pdf; Lucas Leighton Invoice #239.pdf
Importance: High
Contacts: Mike Ouellet - Metallak ATV Club

Hi Mike,
Attached please find the FINAL account statement for the club for the 2017 season. This grantis CLOSED.

| have processed payment for one bill that was left in the file from Clark Jeffers for $1100 for the emergency Town
Forest Trail repair. You need to send me a copy of check #550 (front & back) that was used to pay this invoice. Please
note that | cannot pay anything for this season’s grant, 2018, until | get this check.

There was one bill left in the 2017 file that was for Lucas Leighton (see attached) that | was unable to pay as it
does not specify the dates the work was done or how many hours the equipment was used, it just has a total amount, and
no check was ever submitted for it.

| will await the copy of check #550 so | will be able to pay 2018 funds when you submit bills. Thanks!
Lisa

Lisa A. Meffert
Program Specialist
Bureau of Trails/Grant-In-Aid Program
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lM«iffert, Lisa

— S ————
From: Mike Ouellet <[ NN
Sent: Tuesday, September 25, 2018 3:21 PM
To: Meffert, Lisa
Subject: Check
Attachments: Ivservices@landvest.com_20180925_144216.pdf

Sent from my iPhone





